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Office of the Police and
Crime Commissioner

FOI 16245 Statistical figures held for Shekinah/Make Amends

Request:

Please can you provide me any and all statistical figures you hold for Shekinah /
Make Amends regarding their Restorative Justice operations.

Most specifically to include:

- how many referrals are made to them

- how many cases you receive Outcome Monitoring information forms for
- how many cases are closed by the organisation without reason provided
- a breakdown of closed cases by reason for case closure

Schedule of Response Information:

Following receipt of your request, | can confirm the Office of the Police and Crime
Commissioner (OPCC) holds some information relevant to your request. Please see
the information below.

1. How many referrals are made to them (Shekinah/Make Amends)

For the period of 1st April 2024 — 30th September 2025, 273 referrals were made.

2. How many cases you receive Outcome Monitoring information forms for
(from Shekinah/Make Amends)

The OPCC does not hold any information in relation to this part of your request.

3. How many cases are closed by the organisation (Shekinah/Make
Amends) without reason provided

For the period of 1st April 2024 — 30th September 2025, 27 cases were closed
without a reason provided.

4. A breakdown of closed cases by reason for case closure (by
Shekinah/Make Amends)

The OPCC does not hold any information in relation to this part of your request.
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